
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

Primary school Jihlava, Jungmannova 6, 

contributory organization 

Timetable - transport of pupils to Primary school Jihlava, Jungmannova 6, contributory 
organization: 
from 3 September 2019 
 
7:20 Horní Kosov (bus stop)  – runs along Lípová streets 

 Rantířovská 

 U Cvičiště at the trolleybus stop “D, F” „D,F“ U Hřbitova – Dům zdraví  

 stop Na Hliništi  

 17. listopadu 

 continues to Tolstého Street to the stop Vysoká škola polytechnická  

 continues to Legionářů Street to Fritzova stop 

 Chlumova 

 Masarykovo náměstí Horní 

 Masarykovo náměstí  Dolní (trolleybus stop) 

 turns in trolleybus E and continues Chlumova  

 Gorkého 

 Kaufland 

 Královský vršek 

 continues on ul. 5.května 

 and Zrzavý Street to Jungmannova School.  
 

 

 Individual approach to each pupil 

 Family-type school 



 

 

 

Possibility of an individual tour of the school in agreement with 

the school head. 

More information about the school can be found at www.jungzs.cz 

 

We will be pleased to answer your questions at 567 564 441 

or e-mail ivana.malkova@jungzs.cz 

We look forward to you 
 

Primary school Jihlava, Jungmannova 6, contributory organization 
 
The school is located on the outskirts of the city, in a quiet zone. Barrier-free access is provided throughout the 
campus. The building of the school is large, with enough space for tribal classes, professional classrooms, relaxation 
rooms, gym, library, information centre. The school also has a multi-sensory room - snoezelen. The fenced area 
includes a school grounds with an arboretum and a ball track, a multifunctional playground, a long jump area, an 
outdoor gym, a playground, an outdoor classroom. 
 
The advantages of the school include above-standard equipment for teaching physical education - small trampolines, 
cross-trainer, exercise bike, boxing machines, treadmills, suspension systems TRX, Flowin, Bosu, large trampoline, 
table tennis facilities and more. Music education equipment - drum kit, electronic drum kit, drumbeats for all pupils. 
Premises and equipment of professional classrooms - training apartment, metal workshop, wood workshop, art 
workshop, ceramic workshop. In all tribal classes, there are data projectors, in some classes also interactive 
whiteboards.  
 
The school is fully organized. It provides education for pupils from the 1st to 9th years and for children in the 
preparatory class.  
 
Its number of pupils ranks among small family-type schools with great emphasis on individual approach to each pupil 
and pupils - foreigners, differentiated education of each pupil, teaching in classes with a small number of pupils, 
teaching in special classes according to §16, paragraph 9 of the Education Act. 
In the classrooms, we offer a comfortable, quiet environment with a small number of pupils, using alternative 
teaching methods for each pupil so that everyone has success and experienced and moves progressively in learning, 
improving skills, knowledge, communication, relationship building, collaboration, and learning responsibility for 
himself.  
 
We are trying to build positive relationships between pupils, students and teachers, teachers and pupils' legal 
guardians. Ensuring a safe school environment is a priority. 
 
School education programs according to which the school educates pupils: Open school - primary school education 
program, Open school - primary school education program - LMP, Open school - basic education (special school 
education program), Open school - school education pre-school education program. 
 
The school creates conditions for the development of extraordinary talents and talents mainly in the music, dance, 
art, work and sports fields. 
 
The school main aim is to give a chance to experience success for all children and pupils, to equip them with 
competencies for practical life and for solving everyday life situations. 
 

http://www.jungzs.cz/

